AZAD GOVERNMENT OF THE STATE OF JAMMU AND KASHMIR
LAW, JUSTICE, PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS AND HUMAN RIGHTS
DEPARTMENT MUZAFFARABAD

Dated: 13th February, 2019

No. LD/Legis-Act/27-38/2019. The following Act of Assembly received
the assent of the President on the 7th day of February 2019, is hereby
published for general information.

(ACT 11 OF 2019)

An

Act

further to amend the Azad Jammu and Kashmir Legislative Assembly
Deputy Speaker (Salary, Allowances and Privileges) Act, 1986

WHEREAS, it is expedient further to amend the Azad Jammu
and Kashmir Legislative Assembly Deputy Speaker (Salary, Allowances
and Privileges) Act, 1986 (Act VIII of 1986), in the manner hereinafter
appearing:

It is hereby enacted as follows:-

1. Short title and Commencement.-(1) This Act may be called the
Azad Jammu and Kashmir Legislative Assembly Deputy Speaker
(Salary, Allowances and Privileges) (Amendment) Act, 2019.

2) It shall come into force at once and shall be deemed to
have taken effect from Ist day of June, 2017.

2. Amendment of Section 3-A, (Act VIII of 1986).-In the Azad
Jammu and Kashmir Legislative Assembly Deputy Speaker
(Salary, Allowances and Privileges) Act, 1986 (Act VIII of
1986), hereinafter referred to as the said Act, in Section 3-A, for
the words “twenty five thousand”, the words “twenty thousand”
shall be substituted.

3. Amendment of Section 5, (Act VIII of 1986).-In the said Act,
in Section 5, for the words “twenty thousand”, the words “twenty
five thousand” shall be substituted.

4. Amendment of Section, 6 (Act VIII of 1986).- In the said Act,
in Section 6, after the words “throughout his term of office” the
words “and for a period of fifteen days immediately thereafter”
shall inserted.

Sd/-
(Ch. Muhammad Nawaz)
Section Officer (Legislation)

60



