
VOLUME IX: 1989-1993 

41 

AZAD GOVERNMENT OF THE STATE OF JAMMU AND KASHMIR 

 LAW AND PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT, 

MUZAFFARABAD 
Dated 15th February, 1990. 

 

No.141-146/LD/Leg/90. The following Act of the Assembly received the 

assent of the President on the 15th February, 1990 is hereby published for 

general information:- 

(ACT VI of 1990) 

AN 

ACT 

to amend the Azad Jammu and Kashmir Legislative Assembly 

(Salaries, Allowances and Privileges of Members) Act, 1975 

 WHEREAS it is expedient to amend the Azad Jammu and 

Kashmir Legislative Assembly (Salaries, Allowances and Privileges of 

Members) Act, 1975 (Act XX of 1975) in the manner hereinafter 

appearing; 

 It is hereby enacted as follows:- 

1. Short title and Commencement.-  (1)  This Act may be called 

the Azad Jammu and Kashmir Legislative Assembly (Salaries, 

Allowances and Privileges of Members) (Amendment) Act, 

1990. 

 (2) It shall come into force at once and shall be deemed to have 

taken effect on and from the first day of July, 1989. 

2. Amendment of Section 3,Act XX of 1975.- In the Azad Jammu 

and Kashmir Legislative Assembly (Salaries, Allowances and 

Privileges of Members) Act, 1975 (Act XX of 1975), hereinafter 

referred to as the said Act, in Section 3, in sub-section (1) for the 

words “two thousand”, the words “two thousand and five 

hundred” shall be substituted. 

3. Amendment of Section 5-A, Act XX of 1975.-  In the said Act, 

in Section 5-A, for the words “fifteen thousand” wherever 

occurring, the words “twenty five thousand” shall be substituted. 

4. Amendment of Section 10, Act XX of 1975.-  In the said Act, 

in Section 10, for the words “five hundred” the words “two 

thousand” shall be substituted. 

5. Amendment of Section 10-A, Act XX of 1975.-  In the said 

Act, in Section 10-A, for the words “five hundred” the words 

“two thousand and five hundred” shall be substituted. 

6. Amendment of Section 11, Act XX of 1975.-  In the said Act, 

in Section 11,- 

i) in clause (a) for the words “two” the word “three” shall 

be substituted; 

ii) in clause (e) in the second proviso, for the figure “5000/-

” the words “six thousand” shall be substituted. 



VOLUME IX: 1989-1993 

42 

 iii) the following new sub-clause (f) shall be added : 

“(f)  use of not more than one Staff Car regardless of 

his entitlement to an Official Car in any other 

capacity and where he avails himself of this 

facility, he would not be entitled to the 

conveyance allowance under Section 4.” 

 7. Addition of Section 11-A, Act XX of 1975.- In the said Act, 

after Section 11, the following new Section 11-A , shall be 

added:- 

 “11-A Official Transport.-  A Member who holds the Office of 

Chairman of a Committee of Assembly, other than that 

of a Select Committee or a Special Committee, shall be 

entitled to the use of not more than one official car 

regardless of his entitlement to have an official car in 

any other capacity, and where he avails himself of this 

facility, he shall not be entitled to receive the 

conveyance allowance under Section 4 and Travelling 

Allowance under Section 5: 

i) only one Car shall be provided to a Chairman of a 

Standing Committee during the whole term of his office; 

ii) a Chairman of a Standing Committee shall be allowed 

rupees three thousand per month as petrol and 

maintenance allowance and expenses on petrol and 

maintenance of the Car shall entirely be his 

responsibility; 

iii) on ceasing to hold office the Chairman of the Standing 

Committee shall return the Car within three days.” 

 

        (Syed Shakir Shah)   

     Under Secretary Law. 

 

  


