AZAD GOVERNMENT OF THE STATE OF JAMMU AND KASHMIR,
LAW AND PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT
MUZAFFARABAD

Dated the 16" March, 1994.
No. 208-2013/LD/Leg/94. The following Act of the Assembly received
the assent of the President on the 9™ March, 1994 is hereby published for
general information:-

(ACT XIX OF 1994)

AN

ACT

to amend the Azad Jammu and Kashmir Legislative Assembly (Salaries,
Allowances and Privileges of Members) Act, 1975

WHEREAS it is expedient to amend the Azad Jammu and Kashmir
Legislative Assembly (Salaries, Allowances and Privileges of Members)
Act, 1975 (Act XX of 1975) in the manner thereinafter appearing;

It is hereby enacted as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement:- (1) This Act may be called the
Azad Jammu and Kashmir Legislative Assembly (Salaries,
Allowances and Privileges of Members) (Amendment) Act,
1994.

) It shall come into force at once and shall be deemed to
have taken effect on and from the 1% day of July, 1993.

2. Amendment of Section 3, Act XX of 1975:- In the Azad
Jammu and Kashmir Legislative Assembly (Salaries,
Allowances and Privileges of Members) Act, 1975 (Act XX of
1975), hereinafter referred to as the said Act, in Section 3, in
sub-section (1), for the words “two thousand and five hundred”
the word “five thousand” shall be substituted.

3. Amendment of Section 5-A, Act XX of 1975:- In the said Act,
in Section 5-A, for the words “twenty five thousand” wherever
Occurring, the words “forty two thousand” shall be substituted.

4, Amendment of Section 10, Act XX of 1975:- In the said Act, in
Section 10, for the words “two thousand” the words “three
thousand” shall be substituted.

5. Amendment of Section 10-A, Act XX of 1975:- In the said Act,
in Section 10-A, for the words “two thousand and five hundred”
the words “three thousand and five hundred” shall be substituted.

Sd/- (Syed Shakir Shah)
Deputy Secretary Law



