Volume VIII (1985-1988)

AZAD GOVERNMENT OF THE STATE OF JAMMU AND KASHMIR
LAW AND PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT
MUZAFFARBAD.

Dated: 9 March, 1986

No. 351/LD/Leg (A)/85. The following Act of the Assembly received the
assent of the President on 5th day of March, 1986, is hereby published
for general information.

(ACT VII OF 1986)
AN
ACT

to amend the Azad Jammu and Kashmir President (Salary, Allowance
and Privileges Act, 1975

WHEREAS it is expedient to amend the Azad Jammu and
Kashmir President’s Salary, Allowances and Privileges Act, 1975 (Act
XIX of 1975) for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

It is hereby enacted as follows: -

1. Short title and Commencement.- (1) This Act may be called
Azad Jammu and Kashmir President’s Salary, Allowances and
Privileges (Amendment) Act, 1986.

2) It shall come into force at once

2. Amendment of Section 8, Act XIX of 1975.- In the Azad
Jammu and Kashmir  President’s Salary, Allowance and
Privileges Act, 1975 (Act XIX of 1975), hereinafter referred to
as the said Act, in Section 8, for the words “thirty thousand” the
words “fifty six thousand” shall be substituted.

3. Amendment of Section 13, Act XIX of 1975.- In the said Act,
in Section 13, for the words “one hundred” the words “two
hundred” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have taken
effect on and from 9th day of August, 1984.

4, Amendment of Section 17, Act XIX of 1975.- In the said Act,
in Section 17, for clause (b) the following shall be substituted,
namely:-

“(b)  to import any American Car except Cadillac and lincon
or equivalent or Mercedes 280 SEL or equivalent, free of
custom duties and Sales Tax for his personal use during
the tenure of his office:

Provided that at the time of sale of car imported under
this facility, duty shall be paid at the following rates:

6) within two years of import ..  Full duty
249



Volume VIII (1985-1988)
(i1) After two years of import ..  60% duty
(iii)  After three years of import .. 45% duty
@iv) After four years of import..  25% duty
V) After five years of import.. ~ No duty”

Sd/-

(Syed Atta Mohy-ud-Din Qadri)
Deputy Secretary Law.

250



