AZAD GOVERNMENT OF THE STATE OF JAMMU AND KASHMIR
LAW, JUSTICE AND PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT
MUZAFFARABAD

Dated the 23" July, 1995.

No. 608-15/LD/95. The following Act of the Assembly received the assent
of the President on the 19th day of July, 1995, is hereby published for
general information:-

(ACT XVII OF 1995)

AN
ACT

to amend the Azad Jammu and Kashmir President’s Salary Allowances and
Privileges Act, 1975 (Act XIX of 1975)

WHEREAS it in expedient to amend the Azad Jammu and Kashmir
President’s Salary, Allowances and Privileges Act, 1975 (Act XIX of
1975) for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

It is hereby enacted as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement:- (1) This Act may be called the
Azad Jammu and Kashmir President’s Salary, Allowances and
Privileges (Amendment) Act, 1995.

) It shall come into force at once and shall be deemed to
have taken effect from 8th March, 1995.

2. Amendment of Section 3, Act XIX of 1975:- In the Azad Jammu
and Kashmir President’s Salary, Allowances and Privileges Act,
1975 (Act XIX of 1975), hereinafter referred to as the said Act, in
Section 3 for the words “seventy two thousand”, the words “two
hundred fifty eight thousand” shall be substituted.

3. Amendment of Section 4, Act XIX of 1975:- In the said Act, in
Section 4, in sub-section (1), for the words “two thousand five
hundred”, the words “five thousand” shall be substituted.

4. Amendment of Section 8. Act XIX of 1975:- In the said Act, in
Section 8, for the words “eighty thousand”, the words “ninety six
thousand” shall be substituted.

5. Amendment of Section 12, Act XIX of 1975:- In the said Act, in
Section 12, in sub-section (1) for the words “one lac and fifty
thousand”, the words “three hundred thousand” shall be
substituted.

6. Amendment of Section 14, Act XIX of 1975:- In the said Act, in
Section 14, in sub-section (2), for the words “three thousand”, the
words “twenty one thousand five hundred” shall be substituted.




Amendment of Section 17, Act XIX of 1975:- In the said Act, in
Section 17, in sub-section (1), for clause (b), the following shall be
substituted:-

“(b). One Mercedez Benz 280 SEL Car or equivalent for his
personal use during the tenure of his office.”

Sd/- (Syed Shakir Shah)
Deputy Secretary Law



