Volume VII (1981 to 1984)

KASHMIR LAW & PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS
SECRETARIAT, MUZAFFARABAD

Dated the 15" August, 1982

No0.982/LD/82. The following Ordinance made by the President on the
11™ day of August, 1982, is hereby published for general information:-

(ORDINANCE CLXX OF 1982)
AN
ORDINANCE

to amend the Azad Jammu and Kashmir Ministers (Salaries, Allowances
and Privileges) Act, 1975

WHEREAS it is necessary to amend the Azad Jammu and
Kashmir Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and Privileges) Act, 1975 (Act
XVII of 1975) for the purpose hereinafter appearing;

AND WHEREAS the President is satisfied that circumstances
exist which render it necessary to take immediate action;

NOW, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by
sub-section (1) of Section 41 of the Azad Jammu and Kashmir Interim
Constitution Act, 1974, the President is pleased to make and promulgate
the following Ordinance:-

1. Short Title and Commencement.- (1) This Ordinance may be
called the Azad Jammu and Kashmir Ministers (Salaries,
allowances and Privileges) (Amendment) Ordinance, 1982,

2) It shall come into force at once and shall be deemed to
have taken affect on and from the 1% day of July, 1981, except
Section 4 to 7 of this Ordinance which shall take effect from 1
day of July, 1982.

2. Amendment of Section 3, Act XVIII of 1975.- In the Azad
Jammu and Kashmir Ministers (Salaries, allowances and
Privileges) Act, 1975 (Act XVIII of 1975) hereinafter referred to
as the said Act, in Section 3, for the words “Two thousand and
five hundred” the words “Three thousand” shall be substituted.

3. Amendment of Section 6, Act XVIII of 1975.- In the said Act,
in Section 4, for the words “one thousand and five hundred” the
words “One thousand and five hundred” the words “Three
thousand” shall be substituted.

4. Amendment of Section 4, Act XVIII of 1975.- In the said Act,
in Section 6, in sub-section (2), for the words “Seven hundred

407



Volume VII (1981 to 1984)

and fifty” the words “One thousand and five hundred” shall be
substituted.

Amendment of Section 8, Act XVIII of 1975.- In the said Act,
in Section 8, in sub-section (1),-

(a) for the word “Twenty thousand” the words “Forty
thousand” shall be substituted; and

(b) in sub-section (3) in clause (ii) for the figures “1500/-
the figures “4000/-* shall be substituted.

Amendment of Section 11, Act XVIII of 1975.- In the said Act,
in Section 11, for the words “Seventy five” the words “One
hundred” shall be substituted.

Amendment of Section 15, Act XVIII of 1975.- In the said Act,
in Section 15, in sub-section (2) for the words “Two thousand
and five hundred” the words “Three thousand” shall be
substituted.

(Mohammad Hayat Khan)
President
Azad Jammu and Kashmir

Sd/- (Khalil Ahmed Qureshi)
Secretary Law

408



